
September 24, 2008 CHOICES & ILLUSIONS

Dear Spirit Family,

Imagine witnessing a terrible accident in which your brother’s precious body is mangled
and covered in blood, and though he remains conscious, he’s terribly frightened. You
know the swiftest way to obtain help is to take him to the emergency room yourself. But
when you arrive, the trained staff of physicians and nurses see the gore and blood,
tangibly feel your brother’s fear as he cries out in pain, and instead of moving into action
with their previously acquired skills, they engage in reaction and fear themselves, running
from the  room, screaming in panic. The idea seems ludicrous at best, doesn’t it?

You are the trained physicians and nurses, my dear ones! You, as light workers, have
spent a great deal of time building (remembering) how to use your heart as your new
navigational tool, how to self-generate the substance of Love in your Twin Flame Heart
Womb, how to see past the duality to the only thing that is real: LOVE!, and how to hold
the mirror of love’s perfection before every single illusion. The “air crew” is reminding
me how critical it is to use the skills and strengths you have acquired Right Now. You
have built these spiritual muscles gradually, but your strength is now being recruited.
This is not the time to sit idly by or to give permission to engage in the illusions yourself.
Rather, this is the time to make a CHOICE every single now moment to dissolve the
ILLUSION of separation and duality consciousness.

Yes, the economy is tanking and governments are wobbling, and health care issues are
high, and relationships are in chaos, and all other necessary changes to bring life on
planet earth into a new paradigm are lining up, literally forcing us to make a CHOICE!
People are afraid and panicking. But if you, the light workers, engage in the illusions of
survival consciousness, you will only attempt to create from within duality once again
and you will not and cannot effectively create from there anymore!

So when it is suggested that you continually bathe yourself in the consciousness of
making a CHOICE for the real, instead of the ILLUSION of duality and separation, I
would hope you’d avail yourself of the opportunity at every turn of the hand. Without the
habitual exercises that take us to true heart perception, it is far too easy for today’s
subliminal bombardments to seduce us back into the slumber of the old paradigms.

Last week I told you about Women for Women International and Dr. Eldon Taylor's
book, Choices and Illusions. I rarely recommend other’s works, but I am asking you to
pay attention.

I certainly know you’re busy, but if you’ve not yet had a chance to look at this inspiring
program, I strongly urge you to do so right away. As mentioned last week, there is an
unprecedented gift for you just for looking at Eldon's special web page. There you’ll
receive a smorgasbord of information from many of today’s leading luminaries. Don’t let



a single day pass without placing your conscious attention upon those things you wish to
create through the heart field. That means reading works of the highest vibration,
watching films that inspire and lift, and turning off the constant barrage of the fear
generating impulses that are delivered through our 24/7 news programs on the internet
and television! Staying informed is only of value if you negate the impulses of duality
before you with the real of love.

With an all encompassing heart of love, I surround you, and remind you
Only Love is Real!

Angelina Heart
http://www.angelinaheart.com

Click here for more details about CHOICES & ILLUSIONS:
http://progressiveawarenesspromotions.com/hayhousepromo/092008/

When you purchase just one copy of his New York Times best seller, Choices and
Illusions, you will receive over 100 bonus gifts, designed to help you live the life of your
dreams. These gifts are from leading visionaries such as Don Miguel Ruiz, James Van
Praagh, Louise Hay and many more.

Click here for more details.
http://progressiveawarenesspromotions.com/hayhousepromo/092008/

This is the month we're asking you to take your personal empowerment process global,
and what better way than joining Eldon's program. In the spirit of giving, Eldon is
donating $1 per book sold during this event to Women for Women International. This is
Eldon's attempt to make a difference on a larger scale with your help.

Click here for more details.
http://progressiveawarenesspromotions.com/hayhousepromo/092008/

Today you can feel good about:
supporting an incredible charity (Women for Women International)
contributing to world peace (see the gift just for visiting Eldon’s web page)
spending less than $15  on a New York Times best selling book that is changing lives

around the world, and
 all the wonderful bonus gifts you can get, and you only have to register your details

once!

Click here for more details.
http://progressiveawarenesspromotions.com/hayhousepromo/092008/

Angelina Heart is the author of
The Teaching of Little Crow, the journey of the soul

Brilliantly woven within this epic romance are the sacred



Ascended Master teachings about Twin Flames and the necessary shifts in consciousness
that allow for reunion.

“Best spiritual edu-tainment to come along in years!”
 

To learn more about Twin Flames, visit: http://www.angelinaheart.com
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